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Dear Sir/Madam  
 
With reference to your request for information received on 8th November 2023 , I can confirm in 
accordance with Section 1 (1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 that we do hold the information you 
have requested. A response to each part of your request is provided below.  
 
 
In your request you asked:  
 

1. What is the size of the resident population that your organisation serves? 
 
  Resident population of Wigan 329,321 (Wigan Census 2021) 
 

2. What percentage of the resident population in the area that your organisation serves are 
non-native English speakers? 

 
  The Trust does not hold this information please find redirect below.  
 

3. Does your organisation predict that the number of non-native English speakers living in the 
area that you serve will increase, reduce or stay the same in the next 5 years? 

 
  The Trust does not hold this information please find redirect below.  
 

4.  Does your organisation hire any professional written translation or spoken interpreting 
services to aid communication with people who may have difficulties understanding 
English? 

 
  Yes  
 

5. If your organisation hires professional translation or interpreting services, for what type of 
material do you use these services? (E.g., do you hire professional translation services to 



 

 

translate website content, correspondence, legal documents? Do you hire interpreting 
services for meetings, interviews, anything else?) 
Telephone and face to face interpreting provided for patients accessing hospital appointments, 
whose first language is not English.  Written translation service provided for patients, whose first 
language is not English. 

 
6. If your organisation hires professional translation or interpreting services, can you please 

provide figures for how much was spent by your organisation on these services and what 
percentage of your total expenditure this amounted to for the last 4 financial years? 

 
Financial Year Translation & interpreting 

expenditure 
% of total expenditure 

2018/19 £142,273 The Trust does not record this 
information. 

2019/20 £124,627 The Trust does not record this 
information. 

2020/21 £95,550 The Trust does not record this 
information. 

2021/22 £93,004 The Trust does not record this 
information. 

 
 

7. Does your organisation predict that the percentage of spending on translation and 
interpreting services will increase, reduce or stay the same in the next 5 years? 
The Trust does not record this information. 
 

8. Is machine translation (e.g. a translation app such as Google Translate) used in any way in 
your organisation? 
No  
 

9. If machine translation is used in your organisation, under what circumstances is it used? 
 

N/A 
 

10. Does your organisation follow a formal policy approving, prohibiting, or regulating the use 
of machine translation tools in your organisation? 
Yes, Interpreting & Translation Services Policy 

 
11. If your organisation follows a formal policy for the use of machine translation, can you 

attach a copy of such policy to your response and/or provide a link to where it can be 
accessed? 
N/A 



 

 

 
12. Has your organisation carried out a risk assessment of possible consequences, for your 

organisation and/or for the people the organisation serves, from the use of machine 
translation? 
N/A 

 
13. If your organisation has carried out a risk assessment of the use of machine translation, 

please can you specify the risks your organisation identified? 
N/A 
 

14. Do you have an established line of accountability in the event of negative outcomes that 
may arise from the use of machine translation? 
N/A  
 

15. If you have an established line of accountability, can you explain how this guides response 
procedures to a possible negative outcome from the use of machine translation? 
N/A  
 

16. Is any training provided on the use of machine translation in your organisation? 
N/A  
 

17. If training is provided on the use of machine translation in your organisation, can you 
please provide an overview of the training offered? 
N/A  
 

18. Does your organisation have any other procedures in place to adjust your communication 
strategy for people who may have difficulties understanding English? If so, please explain. 
Interpreting & Translation Services Policy 
 

19. If we would like to follow up with your organisation for the purpose of further research 
relating to translation and/or interpreting in your organisation, could you please provide the 
most suitable email address to contact? 
EDI@wwl.nhs.uk 

  
 

Please redirect your questions to: 
 
Wigan Council Freedom of Information 
Online - You can submit a FOI request via our online form. 
By post - You can make a request by post and send it to: Freedom of Information, Resources 
Directorate, PO Box 100, WN1 3DS. 
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Council/DataProtection-FOI-Stats/Freedom-of-Information.aspx 

https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Contacts/FOI-request.aspx
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Council/DataProtection-FOI-Stats/Freedom-of-Information.aspx


 

 

 
 
 
If you are not entirely satisfied with this response, please do not hesitate to contact the Information 
Governance Department via the email address provided.  If we do not hear from you within 40 days, we 
will assume that we have been able to accommodate your request under the Freedom of Information Act 
2000. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 

 
Rabina Tindale 
Chief Nurse & DPIC 
 
 
PLEASE NOTE: 
 
If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request and wish to make a 
complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to: Information Governance Department, 
Wrightington, Wigan and Leigh NHS Foundation Trust, Suite 9, Buckingham Row, Brick Kiln Lane, Wigan, 
WN1 1XX. 
 
If you are not content with the outcome of your complaint, you may apply directly to the Information 
Commissioner for a decision at:  
 
The Information Commissioner’s Office  
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane  
Wilmslow 
Cheshire, SK9 5AF 
 
Helpline number: 0303 123 111 





Accessibility Report





		Filename: 

		FOI 9381 - translation services and technologies.pdf









		Report created by: 

		



		Organization: 

		







[Enter personal and organization information through the Preferences > Identity dialog.]



Summary



The checker found no problems in this document.





		Needs manual check: 0



		Passed manually: 2



		Failed manually: 0



		Skipped: 1



		Passed: 29



		Failed: 0







Detailed Report





		Document





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Accessibility permission flag		Passed		Accessibility permission flag must be set



		Image-only PDF		Passed		Document is not image-only PDF



		Tagged PDF		Passed		Document is tagged PDF



		Logical Reading Order		Passed manually		Document structure provides a logical reading order



		Primary language		Passed		Text language is specified



		Title		Passed		Document title is showing in title bar



		Bookmarks		Passed		Bookmarks are present in large documents



		Color contrast		Passed manually		Document has appropriate color contrast



		Page Content





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged content		Passed		All page content is tagged



		Tagged annotations		Passed		All annotations are tagged



		Tab order		Passed		Tab order is consistent with structure order



		Character encoding		Passed		Reliable character encoding is provided



		Tagged multimedia		Passed		All multimedia objects are tagged



		Screen flicker		Passed		Page will not cause screen flicker



		Scripts		Passed		No inaccessible scripts



		Timed responses		Passed		Page does not require timed responses



		Navigation links		Passed		Navigation links are not repetitive



		Forms





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged form fields		Passed		All form fields are tagged



		Field descriptions		Passed		All form fields have description



		Alternate Text





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Figures alternate text		Passed		Figures require alternate text



		Nested alternate text		Passed		Alternate text that will never be read



		Associated with content		Passed		Alternate text must be associated with some content



		Hides annotation		Passed		Alternate text should not hide annotation



		Other elements alternate text		Passed		Other elements that require alternate text



		Tables





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Rows		Passed		TR must be a child of Table, THead, TBody, or TFoot



		TH and TD		Passed		TH and TD must be children of TR



		Headers		Passed		Tables should have headers



		Regularity		Passed		Tables must contain the same number of columns in each row and rows in each column



		Summary		Skipped		Tables must have a summary



		Lists





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		List items		Passed		LI must be a child of L



		Lbl and LBody		Passed		Lbl and LBody must be children of LI



		Headings





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Appropriate nesting		Passed		Appropriate nesting










Back to Top



